BID: 09-07

DATE: 1/14/09

TIME: 2:00 PM

CITY OF FAYETTEVILLE -

'Bid 09-07, Concrete

1 3500 PSI: 3/4: Min & 1/1/4" Max. Aggregate Size, $74.90

4" Slump 500 D $37,450.00 $76.50 $38,250.00 $89.00 ~ $44,500.00 $80.45 $40,225.00
2 4?00 PSI: 3/4" Min & 1/1/4" Max. Aggregate Size, $76.90

4" Slump 2,500 $192,250.00 $79.00 $197,500.00 $91.00 $227,500.00 $81.95 $204,875.00
3 3&2: Fpii';r?’é;#:)"r;;'g‘ t ﬂa;‘l'u‘:f’sregate Size 1,000 $81.90 © $81,900.00 $84.50 $84,500.00 $96.00 $96,000.00 $85.45 $85,450.00
4 5000 PSI: 3/4" Min & 1/1/4" Max. Aggregate Size, $80.90

4" Slump 100 , $8,090.00 $84.00 $8,400.00 $95.00 $9,500.00 $85.95 $8,595.00
3 |4000 PSI: 1/1/2" Aggregate Size (subject to availabiiy) 500 $76.90 $38,450.00 $79.00 $30,500.00 | - N/A $84.95 $42 475.00
6 |1% Calcium Chloride Admixture 100 $2.50 $250.00 $2.50 $250.00 $3.00 $300.00 $2.50 $250.00
7 |2% Calcium Chloride Admixture 60 $5.00 $300.00 $5.00 $300.00 $6.00 $360.00 $5.00 $300.00
8 |Air Entraining Admixture 2,500 Included $0.00 $0.00 No Charge $0.00 $0.00
9 |Hot Water 500 $3.00 $1,500.00 $4.00 $2,000.00 $5.00 $2,500.00 $3.00 $1,500.00
10 [3/4" Rock 3,000 $1.25 $3,750.00 $1.50 $4,500.00 $2.00 $6,000.00 $2.00 $6,000.00
11 ' |Exposed Aggregate - 4000 PSI 50 $90.00 $4,500.00 $91.00 $4,550.00 $103.00 $5,150.00 $90.00 $4,500.00
12 |Flowable Fill - per AHTD Selected Material 50 $70.00 $3,500.00 $70.00 $3,500.00 $85.00 $4,250.00 $60.00 $3,000.00

ightweight Concrete - 3500 PSI $100.00 $4,900.00 $124.00 $6,200.0 $5,000

14 |{Type I Portland Cement 100 No Bid $128.00 $12,800.00 No Bid $130.00 $13,000.00
15 |Concrete Sand 100 $22.00 $2,200.00 $21.00 $2,100.00 No Bid $20.00 $2,000.00
16 |Masonry Sand 50 $22.00 $1,100.00 $23.00 $1,150.00 No Bid $23.00 $1,150.00

TOTAL BID PRICE= $380,240.00 $404,200.00 $402,260.00 $418,320.00

*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting minimum specifications and formal authorization by City officials.
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