BID: 09-08

DATE: 1/14/09

2:00 PM

CITY OF FAYETTEVILLE

Bid 09-08, Asphalt and Aggregate

eYille

ARKANSTAS

J

s i i, R

Asphalt Millings (picked up by Vendor from City of Fayetteville)

No Bid

No Bid

.$60.00 hr

e ASEéT‘I'OVl;l“A:BULKV MATERIAL ITEMSFOR PURCHAéE‘ ‘Hutchens Consfruction : Kiewit Southern Co. ‘McCIinton-A‘nchor Northwes't Arkansas Northwest Ark“ansas Truck Rogers Group - .OPT 1 Rogers G_r oup - OF.'T 2
G : : : : ; G : : RO B . : Companies Quarries, LLC Service Lowell Location Fayetteville Location
— : W@e 7 z ; . 1
Asphalt Concrete Hot Mix Surface Course Type 2 (3/4" max stone) 15,000 $40.98 $614,700.00 $43.40 $651,000.00 $47.00 $705,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Asphalt Concrete Superpave Surface Course (12.5mm max stone) 3,000 $67.50 $202,500.00 No Bid $68.00 $204,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Asphalt Concrete Hot Mix Binder (1.5" max stone) 1,000 $40.00 $40,000.00 $40.00 $40,000.00 $43.50 $43,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant Mix (1/2" max stone) 250 $85.00 $21,250.00 No Bid $95.00 $23,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tack Oil 10,000 Gal $3.25 $32,500.00 $3.50 $35,000.00 $4.00 $40,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2?'@2&23.‘12?32?&?25.5 g?ysll.ti?nits) 25,000 No Bid $4.65 $116,250.00 NoBid . No Bid $60.00 hr No Bid No Bid
Class 7 Base (SB-2) - includes wet and dry 30,000 No Bid See NWAQ $6.30 [ $189,000.00 $5.85 $175,500.00 $10.00 $300,000.00 $6.50 $195,000.00 $6.00 $180,000.00
Concrete Aggregate - 1.5" 500 No Bid See NWAQ No Bid $7.50 $3,750.00 No Bid $8.25 $4,125.00 No Bid -
Concrete Aggregate - 3/4" 500 No Bid See NWAQ No Bid $8.40 $4,200.00 $12.00 $6,000.00 $9.00 $4,500.00 $9.00 $4,500.00
"B" Stone 2,500 No Bid See NWAQ $6.25 l $15,625.00 $6.50 $16,250.00 $10.25 $25,625.00 $7.00 $17,500.00 $7.00 $17,500.00
Abrasives / Grit (1/4” chips) 500 No Bid See NWAQ No Bid $5.75 $2,875.00 No Bid $6.50 $3,250.00 $7.00 $3,500.00
Shot Rock 500 See NWAQ $6.00 $3,000.00 $5.70 $2,850.00 $19.50 $9,750.00 $6.00 __$3,000.00 . $6.00 $3,000.00
TOTAL BID BASED SECTION A=  $842,250.00 $1,223,875.00 $205,425.00 $341,375.00 . 0 £ $208,500.00°

Asphalt Millings {delivered to Vendor at convenience of City Staff)

$6.00

No Bid

$60.00 hr

CERTIFIED: s /bl

vV U F(@EN PURCH AGENT

*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting minimum speciﬁcatidns and formal authorization by City officials.

Ael

WITNESS °

0\/&@/04{

DATE




