- BID: 09-31
DATE: 3/31/09
2:00 PM

CITY OF FAYETTEVILLE

Bid 09-31, Asphalt and Aggregate - Quarter 2

S e

Boild

Hutchens Construction - | - Kiewit Southei

)

_ Asphalt Concrete Hot i.x St;rféce Course Type 2 (3/4" max stone) 6,000 $39.70 $238,200.00 $38.49 | 5230,940.00 $230,940.00 $37.79 $226,740.00 No Bid
Asphalt Concrete Superpave Surface Course (12.5mm max stone) 1,000 $65.00 $65,000.00 $68.50 $68,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Asphalt Concrete Hot Mix Binder (1.5" max stone) 250 $39.00 $9,750.00 $38.00 $9,500.00 $70.00 $17,500.00 $35.15 $8,787.50 No Bid
Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant Mix (1/2" max stone) 100 $95.00 $9,500.00 $80.00 $8,000.00 $70.00 $7,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Tack Cil 3,500 Gal $3.50 $12,250.00 $2.95 $10,325.00 No Bid $3.50 $12,250.00 No Bid
?;’i:gzjZgﬁ?,:}f,?:;etzﬁﬁ;‘gf: Eirt:%ts) 735 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.65 $3.417.75 $60.00 per hour
.TOTAL EID BASED SECTION A=
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CERTIFIED: M

*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting minimum specifications and formal authorization by City officials. .
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