
ARKA

BID: 11-06
DATE: 12110110
TIME: 2:00 PM
CITY OF FAYETTEVILLE

Bid 1 1-06, Goncrete

APAC - Central, lnc. Beaver Lake Concrete, lnc. G C C/M i d -Co nti n e nt Co n c rete Tune Concrete Company
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3500 PSI 11114" Max. Aggregate Size,4" Slump 500 $60.00 $30,000.00 $62.00 $31,000.00 $67.00 $33,500.00 $56.85 $28,425.00
4000 PSI 11114" Max. Aggregate Size,4" Slump 2,500 $62.00 $15s.000.00 $62.00 $155,000.00 $69.00 $172,500.00 $s8.85 s147j25.OO

4000 PSf 11114" Max. Aggregate Size with Fiber 
1,000

Reinforcement, 4" Slump $67.50 $67,500.00 $67.00 $67,000.00 $75.00 $75,000.00 $61.85 $61,850.00

5000 PSf 1l1l4" Max. Aggregate Size,4" Slump 100 $64.00 $6.400.00 $66.00 $6,600.00 $73.00 $7,300.00 $63.00 $6,300.00
1% Calcium Ghloride Admixture 100 $2.50 $250.00 $2.35 $235.00 $3.00 $300.00 $2.50 $250.00

2% Galcium Chloride Admixture 60 $5.00 $300.00 $4.70 $282.00 $6.00 $360.00 $5.00 $300.00

Air Entraininq Admixture 2,500 lncluded lncluded lncluded lncluded

Hot Water 500 $3.00 $1,s00.00 $3.50 $1,750.00 $3.s0 $1,750.00 $4.00 $2,000.00

Ghilled Water 500 $7.00 $3,500.00 $4.00 $2,000.00 $5.00 $2,500.00 $3.00 $1,500.00

3/4,,Rock 3,000 lncluded $1 .10 $3,300.00 $2.00 $6,000.00 $2.00 $6.000.00

Exposed Aooreoate 50 $14.00 $700.00 $75.00 $3,750.00 $15.00 $750.00 $63.85 $3.192.s0

Flowable Fill 50 $58.00 $2,900.00 $62.00 $3,100.00 $64.00 $3,200.00 $52.00 $2,600.00

Liqhtweiqht Goncrete 50 $1 19.00 $5,950.00 $83.00 $4,150.00 $30.00 $1,500.00 $7s.00 $3,750.00
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Type I Portland Gement 100 No Bid $126.00 $12,600.00 No Bid $130.00 $13,000.00

Concrete Sand 100 $26.00 $2,600.00 $19.50 $1,950.00 No Bid $20.00 $2,000.00

Masonrv Sand 50 $26.00 $1,300.00 $21.50 $1,07s.00 No Bid $20.00 $1,000.00
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Mobilization Fee (After Hours & Weekends) 1 $500.00 $500.00 $300.00 $300.00 $500.00 $500.00 $250.00 $250.00

Colored Concrete Washout Fee (Per Truck) 1 lncluded $35.00 $35.00 lncluded $20.00 $20.00

TOTAL BID PRICE= $278,400.00 $294,127.00 $305,160.00 $279,562.50

*NOTIGE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting minimum specifications and formal authorization by City officials.
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